
The Fouts Family remains 
committed to delivering the 
best value for your 
investment, on spec and on 
time, with features that deliver 
ease of operation, 
maintenance and training. 
Even after delivery, we’re 
always here to back you up! 

Our Pumpers allow you to 
combat all types of fire with a 
foam option. This is an 
excellent support vehicle for 
car accidents and all other 
emergencies. Our aluminum 
body reduces weight, so more 
equipment can be taken to 
the scene. 

We’ve listened to you for over 
three decades and learned 
what options are most 
important to you and your 
team. Today, we continue to 
offer a time-tested library of 
options to give you the best 
apparatus to support fire, 
rescue and EMS calls.
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